
1. Introduction
Building connections with the social community is of
paramount importance in the corporate and the
public relation strategies. In the last two decades we
have witnessed the emergence of an increasing num-
ber of organizational initiatives in the field of social
responsibility, adopting the ”do a good deed” con-
cept as a corporate social norm and an evident tran-
sition from giving as an obligation to give to giving
as a corporate strategy. Until the 1990s, the deci-
sions on the selection of activities to promote the or-
ganization and earn a positive publicity were based
on the need to ”do something good in order to make
a good impression”. In the 1990s, a large number of
organizations turned to essentially differently moti-
vated activities in building corporate identity, image
and reputation, in accordance with a new model of
corporate behaviour: ”do what is best for the good of
the society – act towards the society in a responsible
manner” Ê1Ë . 

Adopting a new system of doing business has imposed
the need to develop and introduce specialized
methodologies for planning and conducting concrete
campaigns. The methodology devised by the authors
of this paper deals with the planning of a concrete ac-
tivity of socially responsible business with the need for
a continuous repetition of the same special event on
different geographical locations, and in a given time
period. It is to a considerable extent based on the fact
that the decision-making process in a socially respon-
sible business is performed on different hierarchal lev-
els in different phases: strategic, executive and opera-
tional levels, as well as on the principles of the special
event organization. In cases the event realization is
conditioned with the time period longer than one day,

there emerges a problem of scheduling the event over
a certain period of time.

In order to solve the problem of the time schedule of
a socially beneficial campaign a unique mathematical
model of goal programming was devised Ê2Ë, and will
be described in this paper. The time scheduling prob-
lem has already been solved using the goal program-
ming (GP). The GP models that can be applied in col-
lege and university courses timetabling are described
in Ê3Ë and Ê4Ë. The problem of time scheduling and bal-
ancing sports events over a large number of venues
and its modelling using GP is described in Ê5Ë. The GP
models of medical personnel distribution are present-
ed in Ê6Ë and Ê7Ë, whereas in Ê8Ë the problem of em-
ployee distribution is also dealt with applying the GP,
this time in the field of marketing. In Ê9Ë the authors
describe the GP model applied in the optimization of
the time schedule of manufacturing processes to en-
sure a maximum performance and minimize the peri-
od of resources engagement. Due to the specific na-
ture of the time scheduling problem in case of socially
beneficial campaign events dealt with in this work, the
time scheduling problem is defined as a system of dis-
tinct representatives (SDR) Ê10Ë, Ê11Ë and Ê12Ë.

This paper is organized in six chapters. Following the
introductory part, the second chapter will highlight
the importance of socially responsible business behav-
iour and the third chapter will describe a socially re-
sponsible campaign titled SVITAC (firefly). The
fourth and the fifth chapters deal with the campaign
objectives formulation and the goal programming
model. The paper ends with the conclusive remarks
and the description of the future research.
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2. Importance of socially responsible business
behaviour

The business entities in Serbia increasingly adopt the
principle that being a socially responsible company
does not mean just meeting the obligations one is legal-
ly bound to meet, but going beyond the imposed obli-
gations to meet the needs of the community, investing
into a healthy, thriving and modern society, into human
resources, environment and developing good relation-
ships with various social entities. Socially responsible
business is a concept according to which the economic
entities that adopt it consciously and willingly go be-
yond their primary function of profits earning and dis-
tribution and try to have a positive impact upon their
work, and the social and natural environment. Socially
responsible business is essentially the awareness of a
new position and importance companies have in a glob-
al society and the responsibilites these impose.

As a modern approach to business, socially responsible
business behaviour has an important impact upon the
choice of values the company supports, as well as upon
the manner in which the business programmes are de-
fined, executed and assessed. Organizations increasing-
ly choose to focus upon a smaller number of strategic
values that suit their own values. They decide in favour
of socially justified initiatives that support their busi-
ness goals and consequently develop strategies to in-
crease their market share or create a desired image and
reputation. They assess tasks on the basis of their po-
tential favourable impact in a period critical for the or-
ganization or their real positive impact upon creating
adequate living conditions Ê13Ë. Similarly, the organiza-
tions that desire to achieve good business performance
are aware of the impact the environment has upon their
realization. Therefore they employ all their resources in
the process of selection of adequate direction of busi-
ness operations that will earn them a wide support in
the implementation of corporate programmes and take
on the responsibility to solve the issues that are deemed
most important for the users, the employees and the
community in general.

Socially responsible business behaviour has a
favourable impact upon the company’s image and rep-
utation. When an organization adopts the concept of
socially responsible business behaviour, it is necessary
that an adequate perception of such organizational be-
haviour be recognized by the target public. It is in this
respect that the public relations programmes must be
conceived, in orger to ensure that internal and external
public should be informed on the socially responsible
business behaviour of the particular organization. The

employees in the public relations sector should encour-
age the socially responsible bahaviour within the organ-
ization, but also outside it, as well as present to the pub-
lic the plain facts that prove that their organization tries
to be a good member of the community. Prior to con-
ducting any activity or campaign in order to send a mes-
sage to the target population, the employees in the pub-
lic relations sector of the organization have to antici-
pate the reaction of the public. The public relations ex-
perts often  act as representatives of their organizations
in communication with the environment and as such
they have to be acquainted with all the events going on
around them and inform the management on the cur-
rent problems that may be of impact upon the target
public’s attitudes, either directly or indirectly Ê14Ë.

Socially responsible behaviour is most easily recog-
nized in the public relations activities. The major goal
in this regard is improving the quality of business prac-
tices based on observing the  rights of the employees,
the customers and the community and thus enlisting the
support of the public and building long-term relations
based on trust and loyalty. The quality of business prac-
tices we mentioned above may be ensured by launching
long-term investment programmes oriented towards
school and university students and for the purpose of a
better education and quality improvement of the future
job applicants. Hence the connection between social re-
sponsibility and public relations as regards a given area.

Strategic engagement of public relations experts in the
socially responsible business can be effected through
the following phases Ê15Ë:

1. Selection of social goals to be supported;
2. Selection of initiatives to support social goals;
3. Design and implementation of programme plans

and
4. Event assessment.

Selection of social goals to be supported. Social goals
should be not more than a few and they should refer to
solving the problems of the members of the communi-
ty the company operates in.  The organization’s mis-
sion, values, products and services, as well as business
goals should be adjusted to them; the completion of
these goals should be the interest of all the stakehold-
ers and they should enjoy a long-term suppor by the
target public. 

Selection of initiatives to support social goals. The se-
lected initiatives should be best geared to the business
goals and tasks; it is necessary that they meet the prior-
ity tasks of the social goal, that more than one initia-
tives be selected for one social goal, adding those that



are not yet included in the currently organized events.
The selection of initiatives should be such that it offers
the greatest possible potential for building partnership
relations in the community; these should be the initia-
tives that are based on a certainamount of  experience
and that will make good use of the existing resources.

Design and implementation of programme plans. It is
suggested that internal teams should be assembled to
design plans. In addition to the employees, these teams
will include the employees from other organizational
units. Also, the community representatives from the ex-
ternal environment of the organization should be incor-
porated. It is important that tasks and measurable goals
(outputs) are clearly set, both for the organization and
for the society. The communication plan should be de-
vised, and additionally required strategic elements
should be agreed upon and planned. The planning tech-
niques are to ensure an efficient completion of a single
event, as well as improvement of the outcomes of those
events that are repeated.

Event assessment. In order that the outcomes of the or-
ganized events be efficiently evaluated, we should first
define the purpose of such evaluation, supply adequate
resources for assessing and reporting, measure what is
achieved on the basis of the resources invested and re-
port on that; it is further necessary that outcomes be
measured for both the organization and the society, on
the basis of the set goals and tasks and the report be
prepared. It is also important that the status of social
goals promoted by the organizational initiatives be fur-
ther supported. 

3. Description of the socially responsible 
event titled “firefly”

The Serbian company Dunav Insurance (Dunav osigu-
ranje) is a large, powerful and modern insurance com-
pany with a long and fruitful  business tradition. A
state-owned company, this insurance company is an im-
portant economic entity, however, also an important
national brand in the field of insurance. Hence the
Dunav Insurance Company is continually engaged in
improving the environment, that is, the community in
which it operates, conducting numerous activities in the
field of socially responsible business. The socially re-
sponsible behaviour in the Dunav Insurance Company
is adopted as a modern strategic approach to the busi-
ness practice and, as such, it has a significant impact up-
on the selection of values it stands for, as well as upon
the manner in which its business programmes are de-
fined, conducted and evaluated. The business policy of
the company is increasingly based on focusing upon a

smaller number of strategic fields of socially responsi-
ble business behaviour. Given that the company has de-
veloped a corporate awareness on the environmental
impact upon the realization of business operations and
hence on achieving the set business goals, much atten-
tion is paid to the decision-making process optimiza-
tion. The company uses all its resources in the process
of selecting the appropriate business orientation in or-
der to ensure the support to implementing the social re-
sponsibility programme. Thus one field of decision
making is the selection of socially justifiable initiatives
that support the company’s business goals to a largest
extent. Another decision-making field refers to the se-
lection of the strategy of creating a desired image and
reputation based on the socially responsible business
practices, and consequently, increasing the company’s
market share. It is in such a decision-making process
that an assessment and selection of concrete tasks are
made, on the basis of their potentially favourable im-
pact upon the company’s  image and reputation or its
real positive impact upon ensuring adequate living con-
ditions for the target public (community).

As mentioned above, when the organization has adopt-
ed the socially responsible business concept, it is neces-
sary that an adequate perception of such behaviour
should be granted from the part of the target public.
Here, the process of making a decision on the selection
of the communication strategy and the media as its
most important segment is of  highest importance.

In accordance with its policy of socially responsible
business behaviour, the Dunav Insurance Company has
decided to organize a campaign titled SVITAC
(“FIREFLY”), meant for the youngest schoolchildren,
the first-form elementary school pupils. The problem of
children’s traffic safety, especially of the youngest ones,
has often been the issue of debates, however, has never
been completely resolved. In order to contribute to the
solving of this ever present problem and reducing the
number of accidents, the Dunav Insurance Company
decided to organize a large-scope FIREFLY campaign
and donate to the elementary schools in Serbia 80,000
“fireflies” – the glowing gadgets meant to ensure a bet-
ter visibility of the youngest schoolchildren on the
Serbian roads.

This donation of the Dunav Insurance Company is
meant to contribute to the traffic safety of the youngest
and most threatened traffic participants. The first-form
pupils have proven to be the most critical group since it
is their first time to participate in the traffic by them-
selves. In this way the Company wishes to call on all the
other traffic participants to observe the traffic regula-
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tions for the purpose of their own safety. Indirectly, the
campaign is addressing all the other pupils in the ele-
mentary schools where this event is organized. A con-
clusion can be drawn that the attention in this project is
focused upon: elementary school pupils, their parents
and the community in general. 

There are two major characteristics of the FIREFLY
campaign. One is the need to plan the so-called multi-
ple special event, that is, define a precise time sched-
ule of special events that are equal in goals, contents
and expected effects but differ by the venues they are
organized in. The other characteristic , actually the ba-
sis of the process modelling, is a large number of par-
ticipants in the process that took place in over 20 cities
in Serbia. On the national level, the campaign includ-
ed, in addition to the Dunav Insurance Company as
the initiator, the following: the representatives of the
Ministry of Education of the Republic of Serbia and
the Ministry of Interior of the Republic of Serbia, the
Minister of Education, the Managing Director of the
Dunav Insurance Company and the Chief of the
Directorate of the Traffic Police. On the local level,
the participants were as follows: the directors of host
schools, the directors of district schools, the heads of
school directorates, directors of the Dunav Insurance
Company branches, the representatives of the traffic
police/heads of departments and the first-form pupils
of the host schools.

The campaign was promoted in the media, too.  Both
national and local media covered the campaign exten-
sively in all the cities in which it was organized. For the
purposes of media coverage, the following activities
were carried out:

•  The special event of donating the first quota of the
firefly gadgets was organized in Belgrade. In addi-
tion to the presence of special guests (public opin-
ion leaders or popular persons), the media were in-
vited to be present;

•  The invitation letter to the media was written and
distributed and an announcement for the media
was distributed afterwards with photographs of the
donation event;

•  Media visits of the Company representatives were
organized for the purpose of the campaign promo-
tion;

•  In case of donating the gadgets to the first-form
pupils in other cities in Serbia, it was organized
through the coordination of all the project partici-
pants, the invitation letter was prepared and dis-
tributed to the media, as well as a scenario and
statement for the media, for each particular city.
All the participants in the campaign, on the local

level, were acquainted with the entire material,
among them: directors of the schools in which the
gadgets were donated for the entire district, heads
of school directorates, representatives of the traffic
police and the directors of the Dunav Insurance
Company branches;

•  Prior to all these, a letter was sent to all the school
directorates, on the basis of which the time of all
the distribution events were scheduled for the ter-
ritory of the whole of Serbia. 

The first event was organized among the Belgrade ele-
mentary schools, followed by the similar events
throughout the republic.

The distribution campaign started with the distribution
of the first quota in the ”Borislav Peki}” elementary
school in the Novi Beograd municipality. The special
event was organized at 9:30, 11th December, 2009. The
gadgets were delivered in the presence of the Minister
of Education of Serbia, the Head of the Republic direc-
torate of traffic police, the managing director of the
Company and the directors of all schools in Novi
Beograd. 150 first-form pupils of the ”Borislav Peki}”
elementary school participated, as well as a large num-
ber of representatives of all the relevant media – na-
tional and specialised.

On Wednesday, 3rd February, 2009, the quota of 2,733
glowing gadgets was delivered at 10:00 to the first-form
pupils of the elementary schools in Vranje and the
Vranje district. The delivery was organized in the ”Vuk
Karad`i}” elementary school at Vranje, in the presence
of the director of the main Dunav Insurance Company
branch in Vranje, the educational advisor for the dis-
trict, the representatives of the traffic police, the direc-
tor of the ”Vuk Karad`i}” elementary school and its
first-form pupils, directors of the district elementary
schools and the local media representatives. Following
the Vranje event, the special events were organized in:
Leskovac, Kraljevo, Kragujevac, U`ice, Kosovska
Mitrovica, Novi Pazar, Kikinda, Ranilug, Zrenjanin,
Pan~evo, Valjevo, Êabac, Loznica, Jagodina, Kru{evac,
^a~ak, Sombor, Po`arevac, Zaje~ar, Ni{, Novi Sad. By
the end of the month, the gadgets had been distributed
to all the first-form pupils in Serbia.

Espacially important effect of the campaign is that the
gadgets were warmly received by those they were
meant for, the little first-form pupils. They promised
they would always take the gadgets with them and try
to observe the traffic ragulations in order that they
should be as safe as possible.



4. “Firefly” campaign planning methodology

Analysing the process of timetabling the distribution
on the entire territory of the Republic of Serbia the au-
thors of the paper have come to a conclusion that there
is a need, and also an opportunity to improve the FIRE-
FLY campaign by the optimization of the time schedule
of the events. It is for that purpose that the planning
methodology to carry out this socially responsible cam-
paign was developed and it consists of three phases:

1. Defining the scope of the campaign;
2. Coordinating the participants in the campaign;
3. Time schedule of the campaign.

Each of the methodology phases is characterised by a
different nature of the problem that is being solved
within it and the people engaged in solving the problem
or can affect its resolution. 

4.1. Defining the scope of the campaign

A strategic decision is made in the first phase on the
time period and the cities covered by the campaign.
This decision depends on the corporate goals that are to
be achieved by the campaign, therefore the major role
in this phase belongs to the top management of the
company.

When making a decision on the time period in which the
gadgets are to be distributed, we must bear in mind that
the period has to be short enough so that all the first-
form pupils should get the gadgets at approximately the
same time, however, long enough so that the duration of
the campaign is ensured and the desired effect is
achieved. The ruling criterion in both cases is the com-
munication effect of the campaign that is a requirement
set already at the strategic level of decision making in
the company. The duration may be set to a week (e.g.,
the week of the “firefly”) or some other time period.

Since the campaign can be carried out only on work
days, a set D can be defined on the basis of the period
determined and it will represent the set of work days in
the time period of the campaign, i.e., the set of terms in
which the campaign can be carried out.

The number of cities in which the campaign is conduct-
ed depends on the Company’s financial and organiza-
tional abilities. When this decision is made, it is possible
to define a set of k cities:                             .

4.2.  Coordinating the participants  in the campaign

In the second phase it is necessary to coordinate all the
participants of the campaign in a given city, that is de-

fine the terms (days) in which they are all available.
This phase is part of operations planning and the major
impact upon the solution is made by the participants in
the campaign in a given city themselves.

Formally speaking, coordinating can be described in
the following way. The campaign is carried out in k
cities (i=1,...,k) and there are mi participants in each of
them. Each of these participants is assigned a set Dil,

(i=1,...,n, l=1,...,mi) which represents the set of
terms in which the participant is available. In order that
the campaign should be organized in the i-city, it is nec-
essary that all the mi participants  are coordinated, that
is, it is necessary to find the set of terms in which they
are all available. Formally, it is necessary that the set

should be defined.

The result of the second phase is the set Di, i=1,...,k,
which defines a set of terms in which the “firefly” distri-
bution can be organized in the i-city (i=1,...,k).

4.3. Time schedule of the campaign

In the third phase it is necessary that a concrete time
schedule be created in which two goals should be
achieved: continuity and uniformity in the conduct of
the campaign. We will procede to describe the formal
definition of the set goals.

4.3.1. Continuity of the campaign 

The continual character of the campaign is reflected in
the fact that the “firefly” are distributed in the cities in a
relatively equal time intervals in order that the compa-
ny be permanently present in the media, i.e., that it is
reported on continually. Let n be a number of elements
of the set D, that is, the number of work days in which
the campaign can be conducted, and let r be the para-
metre that represents the desired time interval between
two distributions. The continuity can be formally ex-
pressed by the requirement that the time interval be-
tween two distributions be at the most:

(1)

On the basis of (1) a conclusion can be drawn that the
distribution will be organized in an interval not longer
than the largest  integer (number) that is smaller or

equal to            in case the number of days planned to

conduct the campaign n is larger than the number of
cities k, that is, each day (even more distributions in the
same day) when n is smaller than k. 
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The first problem to be solved here is to determine a
different time term for each of k cities, that is, deter-
mine the different elements of the sets of possible terms
for the “firefly” distribution in each of the cities, Di,
i=1,...,k. This problem, known as the system of distinct
representatives – SDR, Ê16Ë and Ê17Ë is defined in differ-
ent ways. Here it will be defined in accordance with the
concrete problem of defining the time schedule for the
campaign. The SDR problem is modified by the re-
quirement that, if possible, the difference between the
representatives, or the time interval between two distri-
butions be not more than r. This problem is analysed in
Ê18Ë, where it got its name, the system of distinct repre-
sentatives. 

In accordance with the above introduced notation, let
y1 be the term (date) in which the FIREFLY campaign
will be carried out in the i-city,                                 .

The condition of continuity can be written as follows:

(2)

In order to model the continuity requirement, it is nec-
essary that k(k – 1) be introduced by binary variables .

where m is the value that is always higher than yi – yj.
In the problem of  “firefly” distribution, the parametre
m has a real interpretation and means a maximum time
interval between two distributions. If timetabling is
done for all of the n days, the value of the parametre m
is n – 1. This parametre, however, allows for defining
the time schedule for a shorter period as well. If m = q
– 1, q < n, then, in the observed period of n days, with
the respective values of the parametres r and p (see the
subtitle below) the timetable for the period of q days
will be obtained.

Now the condition that the campain should be carried
out on a different day and in relatively equal time inter-
vals can be written as follows:

(3)

(4)

Since the variable  is the term (date) on which the cam-
paign will be carried out in the i-city, it is possible to de-
fine the arrangement between certain cities. Thus, for
example, the condition                   means that the distri-

bution in the city number 7 cannot be arranged before
the distribution in the city number 3 is completed.

4.3.2. Uniformity of the campaign 

The uniformity is seen in approximately equal number
of distributions per term (day) if the initial parametres
are such that a number of distributions can (have to)
be organized in one day. This goal is set because of the
condition of a uniform arrangement of organizational
capacities. Let n be the number of elements of the set
D, and let p be the parametre that represents the de-
sired number of distributions in one day. The unifor-
mity can formally be expressed by the requirement
that the number of distributions in one day should not
exceed:

. (5)

On the basis of (5) a conclusion can be drawn that the
largest number of “firefly” distributions in a city in one
day can be scheduled in case the number of days n
scheduled for the campaign is larger than the number of
cities k, that is, in the largest number of p cities when
the number of days n for the campaign is smaller than
the number of cities k.

In order that the uniformity requirement should be
modelled, it is necessary to introduce  auxiliary binary
variables                                    Ê19Ë:

The condition of uniformity can now be written as fol-
lows: 

(6)

(7)

The condition (6) ensures that the distribution is effect-
ed exactly once in each city, while the condition (7) en-
sures that the campaign is carried out in a uniform way.

5. Timetabling model formulation

The term plan of the FIREFLY campaign is meant to
achieve two goals, as mentioned above. The success in
achieving these goals depends on the ratio between the
number of days n scheduled for the campaign and the
number of cities k, as well as on the available terms in
the cities (Di, i=1,...,k). The FIREFLY  campaign, how-
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ever, will be carried out even if it is not possible to
achieve the goals entirely, and even if the conditions
(3), (4) and (7) cannot be satisfied. Hence the problem
of timetabling will be modelled by the mathematical
model of weighted goal programming (WGP) Ê20Ë.

Prior to formulating the model it is necessary that addi-
tional parametres be introduced. In modelling continuity
and uniformity two types of variables were introduced:
the integer  that represents the term (date) when the
campaign will be organized in the i-city, and that denotes
whether the distribution is in the city i on the day s or not.
The relation that connects these two variables is:

(8).

In the campain participants coordination phase, a set
Di is defined, the set of terms in which the “firefly” dis-
tribution can be organized in a i-city  (i=1,...,k). On the
basis of all Di, the parametre
can be defined as follows:

Now the condition that the “firefly” distribution can be
organized in each city only on a day when it is possible
can be expressed by the condition: 

(9)

On the basis of the already introduced parametres,
goals and conditions, the following WGP model is for-
mulated:

The function of the goal is the minimum deviation from
the set goals (3), (4) and (7).

5.1. Optimization results

On the basis of the available data on the cities and the
scope of the campaign, the plan was devised for the
FIREFLY campaign to be carried out in ten cities in
Serbia in 2010. September was the time period for the
campaign and three possible scenarios were analysed: 

1.  Campaign is organized during the whole month;
2.  Campaign is organized during the first two weeks

in Septemper;
3.  Campaign is organized in the last two weeks in

September.

We contacted all the participants in the campaign and
found out that all of them, with the exception of heads
of school directorates, are always available. Given that
the limiting factor is that of the heads of school direc-
torates availability in the cities in which the FIREFLY
campaign will be organized, the data were collected and
systematized. The data shown in Table 1 were obtained
in direct contacts:

Table 1. Availability of heads of school directorates
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City  Days in the week 
Valjevo Friday  

Zajecar Tuesday and Wednesday 
Zrenjanin Monday  
Jagodina Wednesday and Thursday 

Zvecan Friday 
Kragujevac Wednesday 
Krusevac Wednesday 

Nis Monday, Wednesday and 

Novi Sad Monday and Tuesday 

Pozarevac Wednesday and Thursday 
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On the basis of the heads’ availability criterion ,a date
calendar was devised for September, when the cam-
paign is possible to be organized in the chosen cities.
Table 2 presents the table of input parametres that con-
tains 21 work days. All holidays were left out, and so
was the 1st September since on that day only the cen-
tral celebration is held.

Table 2

The optimum time periods for the SVITAC distribu-
tion in the cities, for all three scenarios (Table 3), were
obtained by applying the mathematical model of goal
programming described in this paper. The values in the
Table do not present the dates in September, but the
ordinal number of the work day in September.

Table 3. Timetable of FIREFLY distribution

Figure 1 presents the timetable of the 1st scenario by
which the “fireflies” are distrubuted throughout
September:

Figure 1. Solution to 1st scenario

Figure 2 presents the timetable of the 2nd and 3rd scenar-
ios, the timetably by which the “fireflies” are distributed
during the first (blue) or during the second (red) halves
of September.

Figure 2. Solutions to 2nd and 3rd scenarios

Both goals are achieved by any of  the thre scenarios:
the continuity and the uniformity of the campaign. The
selection of the scenario to be implemented depends on
the communication strategy, or on the identified pri-
mary target group of the public, the availability of the
media and the coverage of a concrete event.

6. Conclusion

The paper described the methodology of planning the
execution of a socially responsible campaign FIRE-
FLY, with a multiple special event. The scope of the
campaign is planned to be defined on a strategic level;
the executive level is responsible for the coordination
of the participants in the campaign, and the opera-
tional level is in charge of creating the timetable of the
campaign. 

The problem of timetabling is modelled by the mathe-
matical model of goal programming which minimizes
the deviation from the goal: the continuity and the uni-
formity of the camaign set for this particular campaign.
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1 2/09       1           1 
2 3/09 1       1     1     
3 6/09     1         1 1   
4 7/09   1             1   
5 8/09   1   1   1 1 1   1 
6 9/09       1           1 
7 10/09 1       1     1     
8 13/09     1         1 1   
9 14/09   1             1   
10 15/09   1   1   1 1 1   1 
11 16/09       1           1 
12 17/09 1       1     1     
13 20/09     1         1 1   
14 21/09   1             1   
15 22/09   1   1   1 1 1   1 
16 23/09       1           1 
17 24/09 1       1     1     
18 27/09     1         1 1   
19 28/09   1             1   
20 29/09   1   1   1 1 1   1 
21 30/09       1           1 
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Valjevo 17 2 12 
Zajecar 9 4 19 
Zrenjanin 13 3 13 
Jagodina 1 1 21 
Zvecan 7 7 17 
Kragujevac 15 5 20 
Krusevac 5 10 15 
Vranje 3 8 18 
Nis  19 9 14 
Novi Sad  11 6 16 
Po`arevac 17 2 12 
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On the basis of the devised WGP model it is possible to
simulate different scenarios for the execution of the
FIREFLY campaign, and these refer to the scope of the
campaign  (the number of cities and the time period of
the whole campaign). The possibility of the model im-
plementation is illustrated by the plans of distribution
defined for 2010.

The model defines the optimum time schedule for the
given input data, however, the precondition for the suc-
cess of the campaign is that the goals are qualitatively
set in advance, which is not possible to include in the
model itself. That would ensure not only the efficiency,
but also the effectiveness of the campaign. The con-
crete effects are reflected in the timing of the campaign,
that is, linking the beginning of the campaign with the
concrete social situation, the need to specify communi-
cation goals for a particular city or region, etc.

In their future work the authors will experiment with
different methods and methodologies in solving a given
model and explore the possibility of the model imple-
mentation in a broader field of integrated marketing
communication and management event.

REFERENCE   

Ê1Ë Kotler P, Lee N, Corporate Social Responsibility:
Doing the most Good for Your Company and Your
Cause, 4th edition, John Wiley and Sons, Inc.
Hoboken, New Jersey 2005. 

Ê2Ë Schniederjans M. J, Goal programming methodolo-
gy and applications. Kluwer publishers, Boston,
1995.

Ê3Ë Badri M. A, Davis D. L, Davis D. F, Hollingsworth
J, A multi-objective course scheduling model: com-
bining faculty preferences for courses and times,
Computers and Operations Research, Volume 25,
Number 4, pp. 303-316, 1998.

Ê4Ë Mirrazavi S. K, Mardle S. J, and Tamiz M, A Two-
Phase Multiple Objective Approach to University
Timetabling Utilising Optimisation and
Evolutionary solution methodologies,” The Journal
of the Operational Research Society, Vol. 54, No. 11,
pp. 1155-1166, 2003.

Ê5Ë Urban T. L, Russell R. A, Scheduling sports compe-
titions on multiple venues” European Journal of
Operational Research Volume 148, Pages 302-311,
2003.

Ê6Ë Kwak, N. K, Lee C, A Linear Goal Programming
Model for Human Resource Allocation in a Healt-
Care Organization, Journal of Medical Systems,
Vol. 21, No. 3, pp. 129-140 1997.

Ê7Ë Azaiez M. N, A 0-1 goal programming model for
nurse scheduling, Computers&Operations
Research 32, pp. 491-507, 2005.

Ê8Ë Mathirajan M, Ramanathan R, A (0–1) goal pro-
gramming model for scheduling the tour of a mar-
keting executive, European Journal of Operational
Research Volume 179, pp. 554-566, 2007.

Ê9Ë Kalpic D, Baranovic M, Mornar V, Case Study
Based on a Multi-Period Multi-Criteria Production
Planning Model, ,European Journal of
Operational Research 87, pp. 658–669, 1995.

Ê10Ë Mann H. B, Ryser H. J. Systems of distinct repre-
sentatives, Amer. Math. Monthly vol. 60 (1953) pp.
397-401.

Ê11Ë I. Anderson. Combinatorics of finite sets. Dover
Publications Inc., Mineola, NY, 2002. Corrected
reprint of the 1989 edition.

Ê12Ë Cameron P. J, The Encyclopaedia of Design
Theory: Systems of distinct representatives, 2003
http://designtheory.org/library/encyc/topics/sdr.pdf

Ê13Ë Filipovi} V, Kosti}-Stankovi} M, Odnosi s
javno{}u, FON – Menad`ment, Beograd, 2008.

Ê14Ë Aras G, Crowther D, A Handbook of Corporate
Governance and Social Responsibility, Gower,
UK, 2010.

Ê15Ë Wilcox D, Cameron G, Public relations: strategies
and tactics, 9th edn., Pearson Education Inc,
Boston. 2009.

Ê16Ë Mann H. B, Ryser H. J, Systems of distinct repre-
sentatives, Amer. Math. Monthly vol. 60 (1953) pp.
397-401.

Ê17Ë Anderson I, Combinatorics of finite sets. Dover
Publications Inc., Mineola, NY, 2002. Corrected
reprint of the 1989. edition

Ê18Ë Fialaa J, Kratochvíla J, Proskurowskib A, Systems
of distant representatives, Discrete Applied
Mathematics 145, pp 306 – 316, 2005.

Ê19Ë Nemhauser G. L, Wolsey L. A, Integer and combi-
natorial optimization, Wiley-Interscience, New
York, NY, 1988.

Ê20Ë Schniederjans M. J, Goal programming methodol-
ogy and applications, Kluwer publishers, Boston,
1995.

23


